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How To Choose The Right Cable

A Bad Example

Here we will introduce a variety of cables that Seeed offers. When
you make a demo, it's hard to avoid jumping a wire. To be honest, I
hate jump a wire, it's really a mess. But sometimes you had to jump
a wire, you couldn't make a PCB for an easy application.

We had to admit that jumping a wire is necessary, then why not
choose some right cable, to make our demo more neatly.
The
following image shows a bad example of jumping lines.
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Do you feel just a mess?

Then, let's start the journey of Cables!
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Grove Cable

Grove Cable is the most common cable in the Grove system. They
are used for connecting a Base Shield
[https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/base-shield-v13-p-1378.html?
cPath=98_16] to a Grove sensor, actuator, or device. Since Grove
Shields support connections to multiple devices at the same time,
projects may require more than one Grove Cable.

Grove Cables are available in several different lengths, from 5cm
(about 2") up to 50cm (about 20"). Choose a length based on how
much free space available in your prototyping or project area, or
how tightly you need to pack your Grove devices or your embedded
system. Below are some direct links to the product pages for the
various lengths of Grove Cables. Grove Cables are suitable for point
to point connections, for example connecting a Grove Shield to a
Grove device. There are other types of Grove cables for other
applications.

Grove Cables feature four color coded wires and two male-type
modular connectors. Typically, one end plugs into the Grove Shield
and the other into the Grove device. The modular connectors are
keyed, meaning they are shaped uniquely, and can be put into their
mating connector on the shield or device in one and only one way.
When plugging Grove Cable connectors into a shield or device, be
sure to exert sufficient pressure to lock the two in place.

Grove Cables are wired straight through. That is to say, pin 1 on
connector A is connected to pin 1 on connector B, pin 2 to pin 2,
and so on. The wires are also color coded. Pin 1 is yellow, pin 2 is
white, pin 3 is red, and pin 4 is black. Typically, pins 1 and 2 are are
signal, e.g. A1/A2 or D1/D2, while pins 3 and 4 power and ground .

https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/base-shield-v13-p-1378.html?cPath=98_16
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5cm [https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/grove-universal-4-
pin-buckled-5cm-cable-5-pcs-pack-p-925.html?
cPath=98_106_57]

20cm [https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/grove-universal-4-
pin-20cm-unbuckled-cable-5-pcs-pack-p-749.html?
cPath=98_106_57]

30cm [https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/grove-universal-4-
pin-buckled-30cm-cable-5-pcs-pack-p-926.html?
cPath=98_106_57]

40cm [https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/grove-universal-4-
pin-buckled-40cm-cable-5-pcs-pack-p-927.html?
cPath=98_106_57]

50cm [https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/grove-universal-4-
pin-buckled-50cm-cable-5-pcs-pack-p-928.html?
cPath=98_106_57]

Grove - Branch Cable

[Link [https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/grove-branch-cable-
5pcs-pack-p-847.html?cPath=98_106_57]]

Grove Branch Cable is a cable used in the Grove system. It consists
of three male-type latching connectors and four color-coded wires.
Grove Branch Cables can be used to support daisy-chaining
multiple Grove devices to a Grove shield. Typically, one end is
connected to a Grove shield, and the second and third connectors
are attached to two Grove devices.

https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/grove-universal-4-pin-buckled-5cm-cable-5-pcs-pack-p-925.html?cPath=98_106_57
https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/grove-universal-4-pin-20cm-unbuckled-cable-5-pcs-pack-p-749.html?cPath=98_106_57
https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/grove-universal-4-pin-buckled-30cm-cable-5-pcs-pack-p-926.html?cPath=98_106_57
https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/grove-universal-4-pin-buckled-40cm-cable-5-pcs-pack-p-927.html?cPath=98_106_57
https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/grove-universal-4-pin-buckled-50cm-cable-5-pcs-pack-p-928.html?cPath=98_106_57
https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/grove-branch-cable-5pcs-pack-p-847.html?cPath=98_106_57
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As with other members of the Grove cable family, the male
connectors are keyed. This means that they are shaped uniquely
and will fit one and only one way into their matching connectors on
shields and devices. Also, when attaching the connectors to shields
or devices, be sure to press firmly to mate the male connectors on
the Grove Branch Cable with the female receptacles on the Grove
shield or Grove devices. Since Grove Branch Cables have latches
(sometimes referred to as "buckles" or "buckled cables"), when the
latch closes, you will hear a small sound and should see the latch
close over its corresponding part.

These latches (or buckles) improve connections, and are especially
handy in high-vibration or production environments, since some
force must be used when disconnecting the cable. When moving
your Grove device, or changing it, you must also apply a small bit of
pressure to release the latch on the Grove Branch Cable connector,
and then pull to remove the it from the receptacle or socket.

Use extra care if connecting multiple devices using the Grove
Branch Cable. Be aware that the analog or digital pin on the Grove
Shield will be shared by both Grove devices. Such configurations
may be inappropriate for two analog devices. Using a Grove Branch
Cable to connect an analog and a digital Grove device may not work
at all.
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Sample applications include:

Connecting or daisy chaining two or more I2C devices. Multiple
branch cables can be used to extend I2C busses.

Connecting two devices that need to work at the same time.
For example, a LED
[https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/grove-led-p-767.html?
cPath=81_35] and a Relay
[https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/grove-relay-p-769.html?
cPath=39_42] could be connected to a Grove Shield using a
single Grove Branch Cable. It would then be possible to turn
both the LED and the Relay off or on simultaneously since the
two devices would be controlled by a single digital pin.

https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/grove-led-p-767.html?cPath=81_35
https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/grove-relay-p-769.html?cPath=39_42
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Grove - Branch Cable for Servo

[Link [https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/grove-branch-cable-for-
servo5pcs-pack-p-753.html?cPath=98_106_57]]

Grove Branch Cable for Servos are another type of Grove Cable, and
are primarily used to connect one or two servos to your project.
They consist of three connectors: one keyed four pin male
connector suitable for connecting to a Grove Shield, and two three
pin male post-type connectors. In this configuration, power and
ground (pins 3 and 4 from the four pin male) are carried to both
three pin male connectors. Pin 1 (yellow)of the four pin connector is
connected to one of the pins of the Arduino capable of PWM, and is
carried out to one of the three pin male post connectors. Pin 2
(white wire) of the four pin connector is also connected to a second
PWM-capable pin of the Arduino, and is carried out to the second
three pin male post connector.

The four pin keyed connector of the Grove Branch Cable for Servos
will usually be connected to a Grove Shield digital socket such as
D2-D9. When connecting servos, make a note of the wire color of
the digital PWM cable (yellow or white) to know which digital pin
corresponds to the servo input.

Note that the Arduino UNO supports PWM on pins 3, 5, 6, 9, 10, and
11. On the Arduino Mega, it works on pins 2 - 13 and 44 - 46. Older
Arduino boards with an ATmega8 only support analogWrite() on
pins 9, 10, and 11.

Here's a link to some of our Servos
[https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/index.php?

https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/grove-branch-cable-for-servo5pcs-pack-p-753.html?cPath=98_106_57
https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/index.php?main_page=advanced_search_result&search_in_description=0&keyword=servo&x=-1297&y=-60
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main_page=advanced_search_result&search_in_description=0&key
word=servo&x=-1297&y=-60].

Grove to 4pin Female Jumper

You can use it for:

Connect Grove device to the other MCUs, such as you want to
connect Grove - Light Sensor
[https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/grove-light-sensor-p-
746.html?cPath=25_27] to Raspberry Pi
[http://www.raspberrypi.org/].

Use Base Shield to control some non-grove device

https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/index.php?main_page=advanced_search_result&search_in_description=0&keyword=servo&x=-1297&y=-60
https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/grove-light-sensor-p-746.html?cPath=25_27
http://www.raspberrypi.org/
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Some Other Cables

There're some other cables for different use, clkic here
[https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/index.php?
main_page=advanced_search_result&search_in_description=0&key
word=cable&inc_subcat=0&sort=20a&page=1]to find more
information.

Tech Support

Please submit any technical issue into our forum
[https://forum.seeedstudio.com/]. 


https://www.seeedstudio.com/depot/index.php?main_page=advanced_search_result&search_in_description=0&keyword=cable&inc_subcat=0&sort=20a&page=1
https://forum.seeedstudio.com/
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[https://www.seeedstudio.com/act-4.html?
utm_source=wiki&utm_medium=wikibanner&utm_campaign=newpr

oducts]

https://www.seeedstudio.com/act-4.html?utm_source=wiki&utm_medium=wikibanner&utm_campaign=newproducts

